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Evans Chaffee Construction Group, Inc.

e Ev ans P.O. Box 8266

CONTTRUCTION CEOUF Avon, Colorado 81620

(970) 845-0466
Chaffee

CLIENT: Sample BREAKDOWN FOR SQUARE FOOTAGE (BY FLOOR)
ARCHITECT: Sample First Floor: 11320
JOB: Sample Second Floor: 10987
BID DATE: Sample 0.00 300
PLANS DATED: Sample Mechanical Mezzanine: 945
LAST REVISED/PRINTED: 3:01 PM 01-Oct-02 Total: 23552
[NET USABLE SF: | 23552 SF_| [uniTs: ] n/a] [ SITE:[  149530] SF|
SUMMARY Schematic $ %
COST /SE Estimate Difference  Difference

Div 2 Sitework 664,581 $28.22 /sf $727,000 ($62,419) -9.4%
Div 3 Concrete 565,468 $24.01 /sf $604,125 ($38,657) -6.8%
Div 4 Masonry 250,748 $10.65 /sf $353,320 ($102,572) -40.9%
Div 5 Metals 92,618 $3.93 /sf $34,026 $58,592 63.3%
Div 6 Wood & Plastic 1,905,742 $80.92 /sf $1,928,056 ($22,314) -1.2%
Div 7 Thermal & Moisture 225,330 $9.57 /sf $221,894 $3,436 1.5%
Div 8 Doors & Windows 239,141 $10.15 /sf $298,542 ($59,401) -24.8%
Div 9 Finishes 473,807 $20.12 /sf $386,375 $87,432 18.5%
Div 10 Specialties 22,279 $0.95 /sf $26,832 ($4,553) -20.4%
Div 11 Equipment 0 $0.00 /sf $0 $0 0.0%
Div 12 Furnishings 0 $0.00 /sf $0 $0 0.0%
Div 13 Special Construction 7,841 $0.33 /sf $0 $7,841 100.0%
Div 14 Conveyances 42,219 $1.79 /sf $88,000 ($45,781) -108.4%
Div 15 Mechanical 842,443 $35.77 Isf $879,890 ($37,447) -4.4%
Div 16 Electrical 470,206 $19.96 /sf $498,000 ($27,794) -5.9%
Div 99 Insurances 18,832 $0.80 /sf $20,000 ($1,168) -6.2%

6,170,753 $262.01 /sf $6,364,952 ($194,199) -3.1%

check: 6,170,753
check: 6,170,753

Permit: by owner $0.00 /sf
Plan Check Fee: by owner $0.00 /sf
Subtotal: by owner $0.00 /sf
contractor's Overhead & Profit: sample $0.00 /sf $0

Total:  $6,170,753 $262.01 /sf $6,364,952 ($194,199) -3.1%
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ADDITIONAL NOTES:
General Notes Bid good for (30) days
Bid Packages #1 & #2 have not been updated based on these plans. This update will occur at the time of final CD issuance.
This estimate contingent upon selected subcontractors & suppliers demonstrating compliance with insurance requirements of ECCG.
Permit & Plan check fee by owner
Bond not included
Owner to provide Builder's risk 'All risk' (same language as found in AIA A201-1997, section 11.4 with addition of coverage for backup of sewer, drains and surface
water & materials stored on site but not yet installed). All deductibles for Builder's Risk by owner. General contractor, all subcontractors and all subs-subcontractors
to be named as additional insured. Policy to stay in place until Final Completion and Acceptance of the project.
Testing and surveying by owner
All use tax by owner
All utility hook up, meter, misc fees by owner
All temp utilities by owner (monthly fees - water, sewer, gas, electrical)
Assumes temp electrical will be available for entire project for all equipment needed
Excludes winter conditions (recommend doing on T&M basis)
All plans and specs needed by general contractor for this project to be paid by owner - if not paid by owner will be a change order to the contract at cost + fee
Under no circumstances shall Contractor be liable for special, indirect, consequential or liquidated damages of any kind including but not limited to loss of profits, loss
of goodwill, loss of business opportunity, additional financing costs or loss of us
Landscape drawings are not included.

Division 2 - Earthwork Includes bag rack at front entry
Excludes overexcavation/import/recompaction due to poor soils except as specifically indicated in the drawings- owner should carry contingency here
No work outside limits of construction included , except storm drain line and rip rap outlet
Assumes no blasting, dewatering, shoring or other atypical earthwork operations will be required
Inlets are 2' x 3" inlets @ 6' deep, manholes are 6' deep
Area drain assumed to be agridrains
Assumes water line in road is not charged and the stub can be removed and plugged. One fire hydrant only at entry drive.
Gravel shoulder on road not included in this scope of work.
Assumes dump site for export within 1 mile of jobsite
Assumes structural fill, determined by Engineer, within 1 mile of jobsite.
Assumes boulders for walls will be located within 1 mile of jobsite.

Division 3 - Concrete & Rebar Includes protection board for all void form
Slivers of cartpath located within limits of construction not included.
Cartpaths included only to the limits of construction
CFA requires 5% retainage at 50% complete. Release of retainage 30 days after completion
Includes straight cement mix for suspended slab per returned submittals
Includes lightweight topping slab at mechanical mezzanine as shown in Architectural plans.

Division 4 - Masonry No stone at base of front deck
Lintels and chimney caps to be Buff Sandstone
No site walls other than service yard walls included.
Interior fireplace based on elevations and sections by Interior Designer.
No stone at entry sign.

Division 5 - Metals Wrought Iron handrail at back of elevator only
Includes a total of 10 bollards (7 shown on plans).
Handrails shown at exterior stairs, etc. assumed to be standard pipe rail.
Includes wrought iron rail at top of deck railing at rear deck only.
Excludes the ADA ramp (eliminated in addendum #001)
All steel stairs at interior of building to have standard steel pipe rail.
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Division 6 - Log Supply & Erection

Division 6 - Log Stairs & Railings

Division 6 - Woods

Division 7 - Thermal & Moisture

Division 11 - Kitchen Equipment

Division 12 - Furnishings

Division 13 - Special Construction

Division 14 - Elevators

Division 15 - Mechanical

Division 16 - Electrical

Based on log shop drawings. These override architectural drawings
Stair #4 (north stair) is not included in this pricing. ADD $12,500 to include this stair for log supply only.

All cedar bid as STK

T&G bid a fir (matches Guest Clubhouse)

Based on ECCG / sub providing samples of finish for other suppliers to match.
Door casing samples to be provided. Distressing still needs to be pinned down.

Waterproofing includes standard five year warranty
Standard firestopping detail included at top of CMU wall in lower level. "Expand-O- Flashing" not included. Don't know what this is.
Includes deduct of $726 to eliminate requirement for owner stock of 4 square of cedar shakes (won't match roof in a month anyway).

All equipment to be supplied and set in place by supplier
Coordination of scopes of work based on bid scope 11400 as written by ECCG and supplied to VRCD.

All Pro Shop fixtures by Owner
No entrance mat included - shown on A2.02 at Vestibule 101, but ID drawings shown stone tile in this area.

Steam Bath equipment is included, but no details of where it goes or what connections are needed.
Includes Chrome TC-135 controls

Pricing based on ThyssenKrupp (previously Dover Elevator)
Includes key lock out controls at each floor for service doors.
Includes emergency battery backup power per specs.

Fire Sprinkler based on glycol or dry system

Concealed heads included where applicable

Covers to be custom colors (included)

Ansul system by Owner

Assumes adequate water supply and pressure

Based on cad files being provided at no additional cost to fire sprinkler sub for background use.
PVC underground included for DWV.

No security system included

Includes lightning protection system

Includes use of MC cable in lieu of EMT in concealed areas. Exposed piping to be EMT.
All electrical testing to be provided by owner.
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Div 2 Sitework

02-20000 Earthwork

Site

mobilization 1ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
silt fencing - building 475 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
silt fencing - tennis 345 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
site clearing included acre 0 0 0 0 0 0
top soil stripping included cy 0 0 0 0 0 0
site cut - export dirt within 1 mile included cy 0 0 0 0 0 0
site fill included cy 0 0 0 0 0 0
parking subgrade prep 19114 sf 0 0 0 0 0 0
patio subgrade prep included sf 0 0 0 0 0 0
curb & gutter prep w/ road base 665 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
Boulder walls - 4' tall with 1' buried 1375 sf 0 0 0 0 0 0
Storm System

18 inch PVC 758 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
8 inch PVC 463 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
6 inch PVC 479 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
4 inch PVC 154 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
gate valve at pool drain 1lea 0 0 0 0 0 0
rip rap outlet 1ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
exterior drains - downspout inlets 11 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
Manholes

M - 4' diam manhole 6 VF

P - 4' diam manhole 6 VF

Q - 4' diam manhole 6 VF

Z - 4' diam manhole 6 VF

DD - 4' diam manhole 6 VF

Drain Inlets

curbinlets- A, B, C, H 4 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
draininlets-D, E, F, G, H, J, K, L, N,

O,R,ST,U,V,W, X, Y, AA, BB,

CC, EE 22 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
Utilities

8 x 8 x 8 tee or wet tap 1lea 0 0 0 0 0 0
8" DIP water main 130 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
6 x 8 reducer 1lea 0 0 0 0 0 0
6" DIP water service 65 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
4" void form under water service 10 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
fire hydrant 2 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
6" sewer service 150 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
4" sewer service 220 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
grease interceptor - 5000 gal 1lea 0 0 0 0 0 0
grease interceptor - 2500 gal 1lea 0 0 0 0 0 0
grease interceptor - 750 gal @ snack

bar 1ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
sand / oil interceptor - 1000 gal 1lea 0 0 0 0
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conduit to event lawn - 4" 300 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
conduit to septic tanks - 4" 540 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
conduit to pool area - 4" 290 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
valve box covers at event lawn 5 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
primary electric 225 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
electric service to tennis courts 385 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
phone service - joint trench w/
primary electric 225 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
set transformer 1lea 0 0 0 0 0 0
gas line trench and backfill 150 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
4" void form under gas service 10 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
meter pit at tennis courts eliminated ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
1-1/4" water servce to tennis courts eliminated If 0 0 0 0 0 0
water service to tennis from irrigation 1lls 0 0 0 0 0 0
Building
mass excavation included cy 0 0 0 0 0 0
structural excavation included cy 0 0 0 0 0 0
structural backfill included cy 0 0 0 0 0 0
building slab prep included sf 0 0 0 0 0 0
export included cy 0 0 0 0 0 0
building subdrain & perimeter drain lls 0 0 0 0 0 0
trench drains 2 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
Pool & Tennis Courts
pool area patio prep included Is 0 0 0 0 0 0
tennis court subgrade prep included Is 0 0 0 0 0 0
overexcavate for pool included Is 0 0 0 0 0 0
sediment riser at pool 1lea 2500.00 2500 0 0 0 0 2500
Subcontractor Bids
Sub #1 lls 360789.00 360789 0 0 0 0 360789
Sub #2 Ols no bid 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sub #3 Ols no bid 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sub #4 Ols 363129.00 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sub #5 Ols 526353.00 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sub #6 Ols no bid 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sub #7 0ls 432795.00 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sub #8 Ols 435678.00 0 0 0 0 0 0
Items by others
generator for temp power 12 wk 0 0 0 1800.00 21600 0 21600
diesel fuel for generator 12 wk 0 0 0 150.00 1800 0 1800
underslab MEP trenching &
compaction 2250 If 15.00 33750 0 0 0 0 33750
placement of underslab drains 2 ea 0 500.00 1000 250.00 500 0 0 1500
exterior electrical trencing 2400 If 14.00 33600 0 0 0 0 33600
exterior light pole base - 60" x 12" 10 ea 650.00 6500 0 0 0 0 6500
exterior light pole base - 18" x 12" 33 ea 150.00 4950 0 0 0 0 4950
maintenance of construction
entrance lls 2500.00 2500 0 0 0 0 2500
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additional top soil removal per B&B
fax dated 4/29/02 1132 cy 9.00 10188 0 0 0 0 10188
0 sf 0 0 0 0 0 0
SUBTOTAL 454777 1000 500 23400 0 479677
02-51300 - Asphalt Paving
asphalt 4" over 8" roadbase - 2 lifts 17202 sf 0 0 0 0 0 0
asphalt 3" over 8" roadbase - 2 lifts 19114 sf 0 0 0 0 0 0
parking lot striping 1940 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
handicap symbols 3 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
Subcontractor Bids
Sub #1 lls 72568.00 72568 0 0 0 0 72568
change lower lot from 3" to 4" 1lls 4547.00 4547 0 0 0 0 4547
additional TAC coat 1lls 646.00 646 0 0 0 0 646
added mobilization lls 650.00 650 0 0 0 0 650
Sub #2 Ols 77500.00 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sub #3 Ols 73500.00 0 0 0 0 0 0
0 sf 0 0 0 0 0 0
SUBTOTAL 78411 0 0 0 0 78411
02-51400 - Site Concrete
Site - All concrete color based on Harvest Gold.
Service Yard - Grey, detail C
place 8" thick slab on grade 1,708 sf by sub 0 0 0 0 0 0
concrete - Mix C2 in 03-00100 cy 0 98.28 0 10.00 0 0 0 0
pump in 03-33000 cy 0 0 0 0 0 0
rebar / mesh in Div 3 ton 0 0 0 0 0 0
Service Yard Entry & Heavy Cart Staging Area- Colored, detail C
place 6" thick slab on grade -
service yard entry 500 sf by sub 0 0 0 0 0 0
place 6" thick slab on grade -
heavy use cart area 3,200 sf by sub 0 0 0 0 0 0
concrete - Mix C3 in 03-00100 cy 0 139.32 0 10.00 0 0 0 0
pump in 03-33000 cy 15.00 0 0 0 0 0 0
rebar / mesh in Div 3 ton 0 0 0 0 0 0
stairs to loading dock lls 2500.00 2500 0 0 0 0 2500
Housekeeping pads at Service area
(assume 6" thick) 210 sf 0 3.00 630 3.00 630 0 0 1260
Housekeeping pads at northeast
corner area (assume 6" thick) 120 sf 0 3.00 360 3.00 360 0 0 720
Site Concrete (colored), detail A:
place 5" thick slab 10,000 sf by sub 0 0 0 0 0 0
place 5" thick slab - tennis area 3,000 sf by sub 0 0 0 0 0 0
concrete - Mix C1 in 03-00100 cy 0 131.76 0 10.00 0 0 0 0
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pump in 03-33000 cy 20.00 0 0 0 0 0 0
Curb & Gutter (colored):
24" wide x 6" tall x 6" deep 490 If by sub 0 0 0 0 0 0
24" wide x 6" deep valley pan 175 If by sub 0 0 0 0 0 0
concrete - Mix C1 in 03-00100 cy 0 131.76 0 10.00 0 0 0 0
pump none - chute cy 0 0 0 0 0 0
Pool Area
Colored Concrete:
pool deck area - 5" thick w/ WWM 5100 sf by sub 0 0 0 0 0 0
concrete - Mix C1 in 03-00100 cy 0 131.76 0 10.00 0 0 0 0
pump in 03-33000 cy 20.00 0 0 0 0 0 0
rebar / mesh in Div 3 ton 0 0 0 0 0 0
Exterior Concrete Sub Bids
Sub #1 Ols 112100.00 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sub #2 Ols no bid 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sub #3 lls 69563.00 69563 0 0 0 0 69563
Sub #4 0ls 75139.00 0 0 0 0 0 0
0 sf 0 0 0 0 0 0
SUBTOTAL 72063 990 990 0 0 74043
02-80000 Site Improvements
Entry Sign by owner Is 0 0 0 0 0 0
log guardrails none If 0 0 0 0 0 0
bag rack at front entry 1lls 1500.00 1500 0 0 0 0 1500
0 sf 0 0 0 0 0 0
SUBTOTAL 1500 0 0 0 0 1500
02-83000 Fences & Gates
Wood screen gate at Service 1lls 0 1000.00 1000 1500.00 1500 0 0 2500
gate hardware 1al 0 500.00 500 500.00 500 0 0 1000
Wood fencing at service yard -
includes all labor and materials 1lls 24000.00 24000 0 0 0 0 24000
0 sf 0 0 0 0 0 0
SUBTOTAL 24000 1500 2000 0 0 27500
02-90000 Landscaping
Landscaping & irrigation by owner sf 0 0 0 0 0 0
topsoil placement (4") by owner sf 0 0 0 0 0 0
install irrigation sleeves - 4" conduit 690 If 5.00 3450 0 0 0 0 3450
0 sf 0 0 0 0 0 0
SUBTOTAL 3450 0 0 0 0 3450

Div 3 Concrete
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03-00100 Concrete
Service Yard - Grey, detail C
concrete - Mix C2 47 cy 0 98.28 4619 10.00 470 0 0 5089
Service Yard Entry & Heavy Cart Staging Area- Colored, detail C
concrete - Mix C3 76 cy 0 139.32 10588 10.00 760 0 0 11348
Site Concrete (colored), detail A:
concrete - Mix C1 221 cy 0 131.76 29119 10.00 2210 0 0 31329
Curb & Gutter (colored):
concrete - Mix C1 55 cy 0 131.76 7247 10.00 550 0 0 7797
Pool Area Colored Concrete:
concrete - Mix C1 87 cy 0 131.76 11463 10.00 870 0 0 12333
Footings (square)
concrete - Mix S1 148 cy 0 79.92 11828 10.00 1480 0 0 13308
Continuous Footings
concrete - Mix S1 46 cy 0 79.92 3676 10.00 460 0 0 4136
Columns, Piers & Pilasters
concrete - Mix S2 60 cy 0 86.40 5184 10.00 600 0 0 5784
Walls
concrete - Mix S2 222 cy 0 86.40 19181 10.00 2220 0 0 21401
Slab on grade - lower level
concrete - Mix S2 384 cy 0 81.37 31246 10.00 3840 0 0 35086
super plasticizer 384 cy 0 6.48 2488 0 0 0 2488
Structural Lid
concrete - Mix S2 416 cy 0 81.37 33850 10.00 4160 0 0 38010
super plasticizer 416 cy 0 6.48 2696 0 0 0 2696
bump to straight cement mix per
engineer lls 0 1000.00 1000 0 0 0 1000
0 sf 0 0 0 0 0 0
SUBTOTAL 0 174186 17620 0 0 191806
03-31000 Footings, Walls & Grade Beams
Footings (square)
2'-6" x 12" 3ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
1-3-4"x12" 0 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
2-3-8"x12" 5 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
3-4-0"x 12" 15 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
4-4-4"x 12" 12 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
5-4'-8"x 14" 7 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
6 - 5-0" x 14" lea 0 0 0 0 0 0
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7-5-4"x 16" 1lea 0 0 0 0 0 0
8 -5'-8"x 16" 1lea 0 0 0 0 0 0
9-6'-0"x 18" 1lea 0 0 0 0 0 0
10 - 64" x 18" 1lea 0 0 0 0 0 0
11-6'-8"x 20" 5ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
12 - 7'-0" x 20" 2 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
13- 74" x 22" 3 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
14 - 7'-8" x 22" 2 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
15 - 8-0" x 24" 0 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
16 - 84" x 24" 0 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
17 - 8'-8" x 26" 1lea 0 0 0 0 0 0
10'x 8'x 14" 4 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
12'x 12' x 20" 2 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
12 x 12 x 16" - elevator 1lea 0 0 0 0 0 0
11'x 6' x 20" 1lea 0 0 0 0 0 0
concrete - Mix S1 in 03-00100 cy 0 79.92 0 10.00 0 0 0 0
pump in 03-33000 cy 25.00 0 0 0 0 0 0
Continuous Footings
1'-6" x 12" continuous footing 200 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
9'x 12" 29 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
10' x 12" 27 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
8'x 12" 14 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
5'x 12" 15 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
concrete - Mix S1 in 03-00100 cy 0 79.92 0 10.00 0 0 0 0
pump in 03-33000 cy 25.00 0 0 0 0 0 0
Columns, Piers & Pilasters
A-8"x16"x 14' 1lea 0 0 0 0 0 0
B - 10" x 16" x 14’ 21 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
C-10"x20"x 14 3ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
D -18"x 24" x 14' 2 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
E-24"x24"x 14' 9 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
1' diam x 8' columns - service yard 8 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
1' diam x 5' columns - deck steps 15 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
2' diam x 8' columns - front deck 4 ea 0 0 0 0 0 0
2' diam x 12' columns - front deck 1lea 0 0 0 0 0 0
concrete - Mix S2 in 03-00100 cy 0 86.40 0 10.00 0 0 0 0
pump in 03-33000 cy 25.00 0 0 0 0 0 0
Walls
2'-6" x 8" 155 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
3-0"x 8" 110 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
3-6" x 8" 170 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
13-6" x 10" 230 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
14-6" x 10" 90 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
15'-6" x 10" 34 If 0 0 0 0 0 0
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concrete - Mix S2 in 03-00100 cy 0 86.40 0 10.00 0 0 0 0
pump in 03-33000 cy 15.00 0 0 0 0 0 0
Structural Concrete Sub Bids
Sub #1 Ols no bid 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sub #2 add 3 weeks Is 257000.00 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sub #3
structural formwork lls 189500.00 189500 0 0 0 0 189500
placement of concrete lls 11420.00 11420 0 0 0 0 11420
tie & place rebar 77 ton 450.00 34650 0 0 0 0 34650
Sub #4 Ols no bid 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sub #5 0ls 302731.00 0 0 0 0 0 0
0 sf 0 0 0 0 0 0
SUBTOTAL 235570 0 0 0 0 235570
03-31300 Floors & Walks
Building
Slab on grade - lower level
1'-4" x 4" bearing strip 425 If by sub 0 0 0 0 0 0
1'-6" x 4" bearing strip 204 If by sub 0 0 0 0 0 0
1'-8" x 4" bearing strip 35 If by sub 0 0 0 0 0 0
2'-0" x 4" bearing strip 78 If by sub 0 0 0 0 0 0
8" thick slab 12,420 sf by sub 0 0 0 0 0 0
concrete - Mix S2 in 03-00100 cy 0 81.37 0 10.00 0 0 0 0
super plasticizer in 03-00100 cy 0 6.48 0 0 0 0 0
pump in 03-33000 cy 10.00 0 0 0 0 0 0
Structural Lid
clean lid with air prior to pouring 10,209 sf 0 0 0.05 510 0.05 510 0 1021
12" thick slab 10,209 sf by sub 0 0 0 0 0 0
concrete - Mix S2 in 03-00100 cy 0 81.37 0 10.00 0 0 0 0
super plasticizer in 03-00100 cy 0 6.48 0 0 0 0 0
bump to straight cement mix per
engineer in 03-00100 Is 0 1000.00 0 0 0 0 0
pump - need 2 @ 36 M + reserve in 03-33000 cy 2.00 0 0 0 0 0 0
pump hourly rate in 03-33000 hr 105.00 0 0 0 0 0 0
light plants for 4 am start 1lls 2500.00 2500 0 0 0 0 2500
fill concrete stair pans 50 ea 75.00 3750 0 0 0 0 3750
Interior Concrete Sub Bids
Sub #1 Ols no bid 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sub #2 Ols no bid 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sub #3 Ols 41475.00 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sub #4 1lls 38122.00 38122 0 0 0 0 38122
interior housekeeping pads 105 sf 0 2.00 210 3.00 315 0 0 525

lightweight concrete topping slab at
mechanical mezzanine 300 sf 6.00 1800 0 0 0 0 1800
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lightweight concrete topping slab at
mechanical mezzanine 3cy 0 125.00 375 20.00 60 100.00 300 0 735
0 sf 0 0 0 0 0 0
SUBTOTAL 46172 585 885 810 0 48453
03-33000 Pumpin
Site Concrete
service yard - grey 47 cy 20.00 940 0 0 0 0 940
service yard - colored 76 cy 15.00 1140 0 0 0 0 1140
site concrete - colored 221 cy 20.00 4420 0 0 0 0 4420
pool area - colored 87 cy 20.00 1740 0 0 0 0 1740
Footings
pad footings 148 cy 25.00 3700 0 0 0 0 3700
continuous footings 46 cy 25.00 1150 0 0 0 0 1150
Columns, Piers & Pilasters
Columns, Piers & Pilasters 60 cy 25.00 1500 0 0 0 0 1500
Walls
walls 222 cy 15.00 3330 0 0 0 0 3330
Slab On Grade
sog 384 cy 10.00 3840 0 0 0 0 3840
Structural Lid
pump - need 2 @ 36 M + reserve 416 cy 2.00 832 0 0 0 0 832
pump hourly rate 30 hr 105.00 3150 0 0 0 0 3150
0 sf 0 0 0 0 0 0
SUBTOTAL 25742 0 0 0 0 25742
03-34000 Rebar & Void Form Supply
Rebar & Void Form Supply
Banner Rebar incomplete ton 0 468.19 0 0 0 0 0
Dalco
rebar fab & supply
foundation - 29 tons 0 ton 0 515.00 0 0 0 0 0
lower level slab - 28 tons 0 ton 0 515.00 0 0 0 0 0
main level slab - 41 tons 0 ton 0 515.00 0 0 0 0 0
masonry - 1 ton 0 ton 0 515.00 0 0 0 0 0
sitework - 8 tons 0 ton 0 515.00 0 0 0 0 0
accessory package for slabs Ols 0 7313.00 0 0 0 0 0
formsavers - #6 male/female set 0 ea 0 10.75 0 0 0 0 0
void form supply - 12,000 SF 0 sf 0 0 0 0 0 0
protection board for void form 0 sf 0 0 0 0 0 0
Rio Grande Supply
rebar fab & supply
foundation - 28.7 tons 0 ton 0 437.88 0 0 0 0 0
lower level slab - 29.1 tons 0 ton 0 437.88 0 0 0 0 0



